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this year. I should like to state that my delegation
stands with all those others that have spoken or will
speak in a sincere desire that we bring this problem to
a fair solution within the terms of the Charter and the
rules of procedure which guide us in this hall.

34. We have before us two documents: the Austrian
draft resolution [AI34/L.66] and amendments just now
submitted by Algeria [A/34/L.67]. The representative
ofAustria has submitted a draft resolution as an attempt
to move the General Assembly towards a solution of
the current impasse in the voting. It does not prescribe
any set formulae for such a solution but, rather, seeks
to have the General Assembly state its desire to see
the voting deadlock overcome in a spirit of compromise
and goodwill. It recognizes that any such solution must
come about through the consensus of all parties con­
cerned with this problem, including the two principal
contenders, the regional group in question, and all
Member States that wish to see the issue resolved.

35. The Algerian amendments, however, in our view,
appear to run contrary to the intent of the draft resolu­
tion itself. While we should seek to broaden the basis
upon which a solution might be found, the Algerian
amendments would have us limit the options available.
I am speaking particularly about the first amendment,
which would have us only look to General Assembly
practice after the adoption of resolution 1991 A
(XVIII). Although its implication is not clear, it seems
to eliminate the possibility of the Assembly drawing
on precedents and practice established to resolve such
a conflict in earlier but quite similar circumstances.

36. Perhaps the situation that most closely parallels
the present one was the impasse that occurred in the
Security Council elections in 1959 between Turkey
and Poland. At that time the only solution to the
protracted voting was a term split between the two
parties. A similar solution was found the following year
in the race between the Philippines and Yugoslavia.

37. While my delegation would not at this time pro­
pose any specific solution to our current problem, we
believe that any amendment limiting the options open
to those who would enter into consultations on this
matter would merely make it more difficult to solve
the current deadlock and should be rejected.

38. i wish to comment on another aspect of our pro­
ceeding today. The United States delegation holds
strongly the view that any decision taken by the
General Assembly on the subject of the election of
members to the Security Council requires a two-thirds
majority. The Charter plainly states in Article 18, para­
graph 2, that:

"Decisions of the General Assembly on important
questions shall be made by a two-thirds majority of
the members present and voting. These questions
shall include: recommendations with respect to ...
the election of the non-permanent members of the
Security Council. .. ".

I have quoted exactly the above terms, as they pertain
to these proceedings today.

39. The General Assembly is thus bound by the Char­
ter to make any recommendation on this subject by a

two-thirds majority of the members present and voting.
Thus the draft resolution introduced by Austria, as well
as the amendments just now proposed by Algeria, and
any other proposals or amendments, can be adopted
only if they obtain this required two-thirds majority.
The Charter requires this result even though on the
surface a decision by the Assembly might seem to be
merely procedural. The rule of the Charter requiring a
two-thirds majority is plain and any other result would
destroy the Charter requirement of a two-thirds
majority for election to the Security Council. We
believe that members of the General Assembly will
understand the point we are making.

40. Mr. B. C. MISHRA (India): It gives me no great
pleasure to speak in this debate this afternoon. The
Assembly and the entire Organization are faced with a
crisis which has grave constitutional. legal and political
implications. No matter what the legal opinion-and
the opinion varies from delegation to delegation-it
is obvious that any State could ignore the decision of
the Security Council on the plea that it was no legally
constituted, and this would be the case if the Assembly
were to fail to elect the fifteenth member of the Coun­
cil. Thus the deadlock we are facing is not a deadlock
merely for the two countries directly involved in the
139 ballots that we have held so far; it is a deadlock
for the whole Organization, and it arises from the failure
of the Assembly to fulfil its obligations.

41. It is therefore within the competence of the Aus­
trian delegation to try to provide a way out of the critical
situation. It is equally within the right of other delega­
tions to express their opinions through amendments to
the Austrian draft resolution. We have some amend­
ments in printed form available to us. The representa­
tive of Zaire proposed another amendment verbally
when he spoke a few minutes ago. Other ideas also
have been provided by previous speakers. All have
merit. Unfortunately, my delegation does not see that
either the draft resolution as it is or the draft resolu­
tion with the amendments proposed to it would provide
a way out of this grave situation.

42. In fact, there are five possibilities for the resolu­
tion of the crisis that we are facing: first. one of the
two candidates withdraws to facilitate the task of the
General Assembly; secondly, one of the two candi­
dates withdraws on the promise of the regional group
concerned that it will endorse that candidate for
election to the Council at a future date; thirdly, both
candidates withdraw and a third candidate is endorsed
by the regional group concerned for election to the
Council at this session of the General Assembly;
fourthly, the two candidates agree to share the seat
in the Council, with each occupying it for one year
only; and, fifthly, the Assembly decides to suspend the
operation for this session alone of paragraph 3 of its
resolution 1991 A (XVIII), which provided for a
regional pattern of election of the non-permanent
members of the Council. A decision by the Assembly
in conformity with the fifth of the options I have just
set forth would mean that any State Member of the
United Nations, regardless of the region of that State's
origin, could be elected to the Council-barring, of
course, those that are already serving in the Council
or are to retire from it on 31 December this year.
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